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Ishares Brazil (NYSE:EWZ) after a sideways range the most likely next move is down 

in the coming months  and investing in Brazil is best avoided until the end of the 

year. 

A victim of her own success? 

The Big Mac Index was developed by 

the Economist Magazine which whilst 

not perfect gives us a simple guide to 

Price Purchasing Parity using a Big 

Mac burger. Based on current prices; a 

Big Mac in Brazil is 47% more expen-

sive than one in the US and whilst Nor-

way and Switzerland are even more 

expensive I don’t think you can com-

pare Brazil to Norway. On the other 

end you have China where a Big Mac is 

50% cheaper than the US which clearly 

shows how undervalued the Renminbi 

is even with all the talk of revaluing. 

Regular readers will know that I was 

way ahead of the crowd when going 

bullish on Brazil in 2004 and then 

back again in 2009. Whilst long term 

this country has a lot going for it, 

shorter term ( next 6 months or so), I 

see no reason to have any money in 

Brazil and in fact it’s a great place to 

have a small short trade right now.  

This is the classic “day late and a 

dollar short” scenario, funds have 

flooded into Brazil in the last 12 

months and retail investors have 

bought into the Brazil feeds China 

story which has some truth, howev-

er, you always have to factor in how 

much of the news is priced in?   
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The last year has seen a flood of new money into 

Brazil, with interest rates at near 12% if you can 

borrow money cheaply in the US$ then you have a 

nice carry trade. As many are pulled out of poverty 

in Brazil they are gaining a taste for what we take 

for granted such as refrigerators, washing ma-

chines, cars and motorcycles all bought on new 

found credit. The stronger Brazilian currency 

makes manufactured exports uncompetitive. 

Meanwhile, cheap Chinese imports, helped by an 

under-valued renminbi, are pouring into Brazil, 

hurting the domestic manufacturing sector. 

Also the prosperity is putting pressure on wage in-

flation and many sectors are finding it harder to 

find workers. Office space rents in major cities 

such as Rio are near if not higher than New York. 

It’s a big headache for the new prime minster Dil-

ma Rousseff who has inherited a booming econo-

my from Luiz Inácio Lula da Silva and it’s a fine bal-

ance between slowing the economy down by turn-

ing new investment away without halting growth. 

If we look at the MSCI Ishares Brazil ETF 

(NYSE:EWZ) it’s been flat for the last two years. 

This ETF is fairly skewed by Petrobras (NYSE:PBR) 

which has an 18% weighting followed by mining 

(NYSE:VALE) which I am currently short as I’m looking 

for lower industrial metal prices in the coming 

months. 

The Market Vector Brazil Small Cap ETF (NYSE:BRF) 

has done far better and is up over 138% since it was 

launched by Van Eck in May 2009. This ETF features 

companies which have more domestic exposure with 

a fair amount of exposure to the local property/

construction market such as Gafisa SA (NYSE: GFA). 

So far this year BRF is down around 2% and finding it 

hard to make any headway and in fact many Europe-

an markets such as Spain, France and Italy have 

made better returns. You can look to short Brazil by 

spread betting the EWZ or buying the Ultrashort In-

verse ETF (BZQ). 

 

 

 

Below: The BIG MAC index is not a short term indica-

tor but can be used as a guide. The fact that a Big 

Mac costs more in Brazil then the US flags up the 

overvalued currency. We also see the Euro is 32% 

over valued against the US$, a return to in line would 

see the rate the Euro/$ at parity. Notice the GBP/

US$ is fairly valued and almost at PPP 
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Short Ideas 

3 of my current shorts which 

are also currently shorted by 

Hedge fund Kynikos Associ-

ates  (Kynikos is greek for cyn-

ic) run by Jim Chanos.  

 

If you take the view that indus-

trial metals such as Iron 

ore,steel demand is slowing 

then  Brazilian metals giant 

VALE and South Korean 

POSCO are a way to get short. 

Arcelor Mittal (NYSE:MT) is an-

other short. 

 

Jim Chanos is heavily short 

Chinese property stocks how-

ever its not easy for most 

small investors, however I 

have been short Copper (see 

next page) which I believe will 

give similar results.  

 

First Solar (FSLR) 

You know my views on Solar 

and Wind, nice idea but bad 

investment and nothing has 

changed. First Solar has been 

in a range but looks like its 

ready to break lower. Interest-

ing to see that directors have 

been heavy sellers the last few 

months. Short term FSLR 

could bounce  and squeeze a 

few shorts but I ultimately see 

FSLR going lower in the next 

12 to 18 months. I would ex-

pect Jim Chanos to be short 

for years here as normally 

once they get their teeth in to 

a stock they stay with it. 

 

Chanos was short for profit 

Education way before anyone 

else and was down for about 2 

years and then finally was 

proven correct and cleaned 

up. 
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Risk Warning 
All trading and investing involves risk and 
you should only invest what risk capital that 
you can afford to lose. These trading ideas 
are based on buying Exchange Trading 
Funds outright, should you decide to spread 
bet then other risks will be present. Only 
speculate with money you can afford to lose. 
Spread betting may not be suitable for all 
readers, therefore ensure you fully under-
stand the risks involved. Past performance is 
not necessarily a guide to future perfor-
mance. Ultimately all investment decisions 
are made by you. Insider Trader does not 
advise when to open or close a transaction. 
If you choose to open a transaction it is 
based on your own judgement and research 
and at your own risk. It is the responsibility of 
visitors to this Site to ascertain the terms of 
and comply with any local law or regulation 
to which they are subject. 

Copper Bear 

As stated on the previous page I am 

bearish copper and intend to be until 

October. As construction in China 

slows down so does Copper demand. 

Copper is not an easy market to trade 

and is prone to a lot of spikes and 

false quotes especially in the middle 

of the night, that’s why I NEVER 

spread bet copper. I buy Inverse ETFs 

such as SCOP or my favourite is the 

Canadian HKD which gives me 200% 

inverse return to Copper, so if Copper 

is Down 2% this ETF will go up around 

3.9%. 

 

Above 5 year view of copper. After 

slumping in 2008 copper has made 

a full recovery and back to the pre 

crash levels, however it is questiona-

ble if this price is sustainable and 

nearer to $3 a lb rather 4$ lb to me 

seems a more acceptable level. 

Longer term I remain bullish on cop-

per but it’s a case of too far/too fast. 

 


